
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Karyna tuition conf. 

Date: Fri, 04 Jan 2013 15:38:50 +0000 

Thank you Rich 
On Jan 4, 2013, at 10:27 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Attached is confirmation of tuition payment 
Please let me know if you have any questions 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
ce 
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