
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: 
Subject: Sacco 

Date: Fri, 16 Mar 2012 15:54:15 +0000 
Attachments: SICMBT_C25312031611331.pdf 

> 

I reviewed their schedule which is incorrect 
Sacco mistakenly deducted the entire purchase amount of the last three orders from our credit rather than the 
75% as we have been required to pay 25% of each order 
The credit owed to us ties into my records and is $56,075.25 

do you want to call your contact or should I call? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10065

fax 646-350-0954 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: March 16, 2012 11:33:49 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT_C253 
Reply-To: 

EFTA00536645


