From: Karyna Shuliak <[ | Y,
Ce: Richard Kahn <} Y . K ::ina Shuliak <[ -
Subject: Re: Invoice for [ GGG

Date: Fri, 12 Dec 2014 00:07:52 +0000

Gregory was in charge of the renovation, | believe he was ordering everything. | can not confirm..
Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 11, 2014, at 3:58 PM, _ wrote;

Rich I wasn't but I can definitely take the list and go through

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 11, 2014, at 1:53 PM, Richard Kahn *_‘-’ wrote:

not sure if either of you were involved with these renovations
if so can vou please verify that attached work has been completed
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Anthony Barrett*f-.}
Subject: Invoice for

Date: December 5, 2014 at 10:42:11 AM EST
To: Rich Kahn < >

Cc: Gregory Riches < =
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