
From: ICatyna Shuliak 
To: Erin Cunningham 

Subject: Re: approved items, Proposal 004 
Date: Mon, 04 Aug 2014 18:31:37 +0000 

The stone floor was approved by Jeffrey previously, so it can be ordered. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 4, 2014, at 12:29 PM, Erin Cunningham 

Perfect! We have stone payment but we will wait until you advise. Thank you!! 

Sent from my Wrinan Wtrelms 4G LTE smanphone 

 Original message 
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Date:08/04/2014 2:20 PM (GMT-05:00) 
To: cunninghamerin 
Subject: Re: approved items, Proposal 004 

Sony, console table is confirmed to order as well. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 4, 2014, at 11:29 AM, cunninghamerin c4

We are all set to order all of these items. Please confirm.:) 

Sent front my Wrinan Wtrelms 4C LTE smanphone 

 Original message 
From: Lindsey Harper 
Date:08/04/2014 12:55 PM (GMT-05:00) 
To: Erin Cunningham 
Subject: approved items, Proposal 004 

<ICatyna Approved Itemsjpeg> 
Lindsey Coral Harper 
Interior Design 
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