
From:
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 20 Mar 2012 15:21:50 +0000 

Yes it was. It didn't go through though when I tried. I need to book a ticket for someone 

On Mar 20, 2012, at 4:20 PM, Richard Kahn < MII > wrote: 

> amex just called to make sure this charge was correct on your card 

> 3/20/2012 $500 Rossiya Russian 

> I told them it sounded ok but wanted to confirm with you 

> Please advise 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
> New York. NY 10065 
> tel 
> fax 

>cell 

EFTA00537498


