
From: 

To:'
Subject: Re: BRIEFING FLIGHT // 

Date: Tue, 20 Mar 2012 19:36:09 +0000 
21MARCH12 //2Y 

It should def work for any iPad. Let me know if it works, or if you still need me to fax later 

On Mar 20, 2012, at 8:34 PM, wrote: 

Cool, does it work for ipad 1 also?? Thx 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: 
Date: Tue, 20 Mar 2012 20:33:43 +0100 
To: 
Subject: Re: BRIEFING FLIGHT // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

I'm not at the moment. Not for at least another hour. If you have iphone or wifi for iPad, download an App 
called Sign-N-Send. You can open the document in the app, sign with your finger, then email it straight back. 
Pretty cool. 

On Mar 20, 2012, at 8:29 PM, wrote: 

by any chance are you by a fax machine„„I need to sign the charter agreement, and don't have printer in my hotel 
room,,,,if I send you the email, can you print and sign my name and fax to Caroline by any chance?? if your near a fax?? 
other wise, I'll figure out plan B 

In a message dated 3/20/2012 3:22:23 P.M. Eastem Daylight Time, writes: 

Thanks dawg. And we will get a separate email with return details? JE just wants a taxi upon arrival to take us to hotel. 
Who should I ask to arrange that? 

On Mar 20, 2012, at 8:19 PM, wrote: 

, note the departure is not from Universal in Paris, that is our usual departure FBO. Caroline sent a photo 
directions of Signature at Le Bourget which will be your departure FBO for Voldsan to locate,. 
thx, da LV,. 

From: 
To: 
CC: 
Sent: 3/20/2012 3:13:17 P.M. Eastern Daylight Time 
Subj: BRIEFING FLIGHT // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

Dear Ms 

Please find enclosed the flight briefing for tomorrow morning and the map for handling "Signature Advance Air 
support" at Le Bourget . 
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Best regards 

Caroline 

De : [mato 
Envoye : mardi 20 mars 2012 19:16 
A : Caroline Bour e 
Cc : 
Objet : Re: INVOICE // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

Caroline, 
Could you pass alon the information for departure FBO, Tail number, charter company contact etc, so I may 
forward to Ms. for coordination. 
I included Ms. on this email transmission so you can include her. 
Best regards, 
Larry 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Caroline Bourge 

Date: Tue. 20 Mar 2012 17:26:43 +0000 

To: 

Cc: 

Subject: Re: INVOICE // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

Dear richard 
Ok no problem )ou can do the transfer in euros 
Please send me the cpy of the order of payment 
Tks and brgds 
Caroline 
Message sent from my blackBerry, please excuse spelling & grammar mistakes. 

De : Richard Kahn [mailto:richardkahnl2@gmail.comj 
Envoye : Tuesday, March 20, 2012 05:12 PM 
A : Caroline Bourge 
Cc : Larry Visoski < 
Objet : Re: INVOICE // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

thanks for instructions 

wire takes 2 days to hit your account as we must convert to euros unless you want to receive US Dollars 

are you ok to receive euros and have credit card as backup security 

please advise 

EFTA00537517



thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Mar 20, 2012, at 1:09 PM, wrote: 

Dear Mr. Richard Kahn, 
Please find attached the wire Transfer account information for Mr. Jeffrey Epstein's 
travel tomorrow. I have included Ms. Caroline on the email to confirm our 
agreement to hold my AMX payment until wire transfer is confirmed by charter 
company. 
Best regards, 
Larry Visoski 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Caroline Bourge < 

Date: Tue, 20 Mar 2012 16:43:28 +0000 

To: 

Subject: INVOICE // // 21MARCH12 //2Y 

> 
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