
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Fwd: Artefacto floor plans 

Date: Fri, 26 Sep 2014 01:16:01 +0000 

Attachments: pdf; Karyna_S_2.pdf; ICaryna_S_3.pdf; Karyna_S_4.pdf; Karyna_items_list.pdf 

Hi Rich 
Yes, has given them SLK info and they created a trade account for us. We haven't place an order for the 
furniture yet, but we paid for their design service, which is $1000 ($800 from it goes as a credit to the future 
purchase). Jeffrey has chosen a list of furniture and they put it together, you can see it in the forwarded email 
below. The total price should be adjusted according to the discount, put please check if it is correct. 
Let me know if you have any questions please. 
Thank you, 
Karyna. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Fwd: Artefacto floor plans 
Date: September 22, 2014 at 10:12:23 PM EDT 
To: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent from my 'Phone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eduardo cz iati ,
Date: September 22, 2014 at 7:51:18 PM EDT 
To: Karma Shuliak 
Cc: 
Subject: Artefacto floor plans 

Good afternoon Karyna, 

As per your request, here are the items with notes. 
We can change the configuration or the furniture to your specifications. 

Since there are different layouts and I am not familiar in which the chosen items are 
supposed to go (usually we work on the plan first, in order to specify the furniture) tomorrow 
Carolina and I will contact you to finalize the plans and options. 

For some missing items, we might not have enough quantity or availability. 

Thank you, 

EFTA00537801



Best, 

Eduardo 

artefacto 
Eduardo Trevisan 
Design Consultant 
17651 Biscayne Blvd 
Aventura Fl 33160 
Phone dir: 
fax: 

APlease consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
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