
From: Karyna Shuliak cz. > 

To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Amex Gold March 26 2014 

Date: Tue, 01 Apr 2014 01:32:07 +0000 

Attachments: Amex_Gold_Karyna_Statement_032714.xls 

Hi Bella, 
I confirm the charges. There are a few transactions with small amounts, that I am not sure what they are exactly, 
so I left the description for them blank. 
Thanks, 
Karyna. 

On Mar 27, 2014, at 12:18 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

> <Amex_Gold_Karyna Statement_032714.xls> 

> Hi 
> Please confirm charges on your Amex, 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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