
From: Karyna Shuliak 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: KARYNA PRICING SPREADSHEET FOR APPROVED ITEMS 
Date: Fri, 11 Apr 2014 17:31:29 +0000 

Thank you Rich. 
Have a great weekend! 
Karyna. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 11, 2014, at 1:04 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Fwd: KARYNA PRICING SPREADSHEET FOR APPROVED ITEMS 
Date: April 1, 2014 4:09:33 PM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Richard Kahn < 

Erin has sent me the prices for the items Karyna has approved. I am not sure what percentage of what needs 
to be done has been approved by her, and therefor what is still outstanding. 
The total for the items below is 
$28 617.00 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Erin Cunningham
Date: A ril 1 2014 at 12:21:49 PM EDT 
To:
Subject: FW: KARYNA PRICING SPREADSHEET FOR APPROVED ITEMS 

I hope you are well. Its finally gettimi, wanner! I like Spring in NY. 

EFTA00538441



Attached are the items that Karyna approved. The bedroom wallcovering is sold by the yd that is why the 
price is high... 

Let me know if you have any questions about Studio as well. We can change anything and would love to 
know if we are headed in the right direction. 

Items approved for Karyna 
Queen Upholstered bed 
Master Lamps 
Wallcovering for hall and master/labor 
LR sofa tables 
Coffee table 

Talk to you soon. 

EC 

Lindsey Coral Harper 
Interior Design 
134 East 64th Street, 1B 
New York, NY 10065 

fax MI 
LindseyCoralHarper.com 

<ICARYNA PRICING FOR APPROVED ITEMS.xlsx> 

<ATT00001.html> 

EFTA00538442


