From: Karyna Shuliak <|| A
To: bellaklein <

Subject: Re: Lobel's - please confirm!

Date: Thu, 21 Mar 2013 19:00:37 +0000

Hi Bella,

I did not make that purchase.

On Thursday, March 21, 2013, bellaklein wrote:
Hi Karyna,

Please see attached invoice from Lobel's and Jenn respond. Please confirm if you made the purchase
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