
From: 

To: Stephanie Carroll

Subject: Re: Brice Gordon 

Date: Thu, 12 Apr 2012 12:58:30 +0000 

I can't get approval for the quote unless I give them a breakdown. Is there no way to get something that shows 
this? 

On Apr 12, 2012, at 8:56 AM, Stephanie Carroll < > wrote: 

You're welcome, Unfortunately my system does not allow me to itemize any quotes. The previous quote was for 
smaller, less panels it also did not include the extra panels, I bar and mirror mastic. 

Stephanie Carroll 
http://www.dullesglassandmirror.com 

This communication may contain information that is legally privileged, confidential, or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please note that any review, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is prohibited. Anyone 
receiving this message in error should notify me immediately by telephone or return e-mail at 

and delete/destroy all copies of this message. 

From: [maltto 
Sent: Thursday, April 12, 2012 8:45 AM 
To: Stephanie Carroll 
Subject: Re: Brice Gordon 

Thank you Stephanie. Can you please include a breakdown of the prices in the quote? I'm trying to figure out why this 
quote is so much higher than the original one for $1,122? 

On Apr 12, 2012, at 8:23 AM, Stephanie Carroll wrote: 

Hi 
Please find attached the quote for project Brice Gordon. Please let me know if you have any further questions. 
Thanlcs I 

Stephanie Carroll 
Sales Coordinator I Dulles Glass and Mirror 

http://www.dullesglassandmirroccom 

This communication may contain Information that is legally privileged, confidential, or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please note that any review, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is prohibited. 
Anyone receiving this message in error should notify me immediately by telephone or return e-mail at 

and delete/destroy all copies of this message. 
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