
From: Rosie
To: 'Daphne Wallace' <a 
Cc: 'Karyna Shuliak'

Subject: RE: Re: Outdoor furniture order 
Date: Mon, 02 Apr 2018 14:51:19 +0000 

Thank you, 

Rosie Fernandez 
Lund and Pullara Inc 
1305 N Perimeter Rd 
Airport Cargo Building 
West Palm Beach Fl 33406 

*'*'NOTE• AS OF MAY 1 2016 OUR CUSTOMS CLEARANCE FEE WILL BE GOING UP 55.00 DOLLARS PFR FNTRY.'***' 

** EFFECTIVE JULY 9, 2013, U.S. CUSTOMS WILL BEGIN FULL ENFORCEMENT OF ISF-10 FILING (IMPORTER 
SECURITY FILING). THE PENALTY FOR LATE, INCORRCT OR NOT FILING IS $5,000 TO $10,000 PER BILL OF 
LADING/PER 
INCIDENT. ** The ISF- I 0 MUST be transmitted to U.S. Customs AT LEAST 48 hours prior to sailing from the foreign port. 
THE IMPORTER IN THE UNITED STATES IS ULTIMATELY RESPONSIBLE AND WILL INCUR THE FINE. 
Please contact Lund & Pullara, Inc AT LEAST 3 BUSINESS DAYS BEFORE SAILING FROM THE FOREIGN PORT!!! 

From: Daphne Wallace [rnaitto 
Sent: Monday, April 02, 2018 9:07 AM 
To: 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak •: >; Rosie .c > 
Subject: Re: Re: Outdoor furniture order 

Greetings Andy, 

You need to tell us what shipping company you are using and send us the invoice, Bill of Lading and the ISF 10. 

Please advise, Daphne 

On Mon, Apr 2, 2018, 9:03 AM "c > wrote: 

Hi , Dear Karyna Shuliak , 

How are you? 

The sofa and dining table set will be made out on 10th this month. Please arrange the shipping. Thank you! 

Also, please arrange the balance USD 12720 before shipping. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 
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Website:http://hsruihui.en.alibaba.com 

From: Karyna Shullak 
Date: 2018-01-2109:18 
To: 
Subtract Re: Sofa draft 
Dear Andy, 

Thank you for you emails. Let's do 20 square ottomans please, like those next ti the chairs on your file. No need for the 
longer ones. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 19, 2018, at 10:17 PM, " wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

How are you? 

Sorry to reply you late. I make a draft of the sofa set with ottoman. Please check whetehr the ottoman 
design is what you like. Thank you! 

And I reply to Ms. Daphne Wallace already. We will inform you and her when the goods make out. 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Websitetttp://hsruihmen.alibaba.com 

From: Kryna Shullak 
Date: 2018-01-19 10:01 
To: 
Subtract Re: To Karyna Shullak 
Hi Andy, 

I would like to have I ottoman for each set of furniture please. 

On the other note, could you please respond to Ms. Daphne Wallace. She has sent you an email regarding the shipping 
process and is waiting to hear back from you. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 18, 2018, at 10:58 AM, wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

Thank you for your reply! 
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Yes, we can make the ottoman for the 3 seat sofa. Please tell me you like 3 pcs or 2 pcs ottoman for the 3 
seat sofa. Then I revised the invioce to you. Thank you! 
I wait to hear from you again 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Website:http://hsruihui.en.alibaba.com 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Date: 2018-01-18 08:04 
To: outdoor 
Subject: Re: To Karyna Shuliak 
Hi Andy, 

Thank you for sending me the pictures. 
The rattan and fabric color looks good. Instead of the coffee tables, would it be possible to have an 
ottoman with the same rattan base and white cushion on top? 

Thank you! 

Karyna 

On Jan 16, 2018, at 10:18 AM, outdoor@rhpte.com wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

How are you? 

I sent you the rattan and fabric color your choose . Do you get it? 

I also sent you sofa coffee table for your choose. Please check whether you need it and reply me soon. 
Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 
WhatsApp: 0086 1591 805 2340 
Wechat: 0086 1591 805 2340 
Tel: 0086-159-1805-2340 
WebsitettIp.//hsruihuLen alibaba corn 

From: Shukak
Date: 2018-01-12 02:45 
To: 
CC: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: About the order deposit 
Dear Andy, 

The money has been sent to your account. Please find attached the wire confirmation. 
I would like to put you in touch with Mrs. Daphne Wallace, who is copied on this email. She will 
coordinate the shipping and proper invoicing with you once the furniture is ready to be shipped. 
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Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 11. 2018. at 10:32 AM. wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

ok, Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 
WhatsApp: 0086 1591 805 2340 
Wechat: 0086 1591 805 2340 
Tel: 0086-159-1805-2340 
Website:111/O/hsruihtti en alibaba.com

From: KantaStadials 
Date: 2018-01-11 23:32 
To: 
Subject: Re: About the order deposit 
Hi Andy, 

I will send a deposit shortly and will send you the confirmation. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 11, 2018, at 9:19 AM, " " wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

How are you? 

And when you can arrange the deposit? Please send me the bank slip copy when you pay it. Then we can 
start to make the goods. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Website:http://hsruihui.en.alibaba.com 

From: Karyna Shutiak 
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Date: 2018.01-10 23:51 
To: 
Subject: Re: About the shipping cost 
Hello Andy, 

Where should I send the payment? 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 10, 2018, at 12:20 AM, wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

Thank you for your E-maili1/4? 

The shipping cost alway change at different time. When the goods make out, I check the exact price for 
you. Is it OK? 

Also, do you use Whatsapp or skype? We can contact easy from Whatsapp or Skype. 

Please tell me your Whatsapp or Skype ID if you use it. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

WebsiteJitt 

From• Karyna Shuliak 
Date: 2018-01-10 13:16 
To: 
Subject: Re: Outdoor furniture invioce 
Dear Andy, 

The furniture will need to be shipped to St. Thomas, USVI. What would be your shipping 
price? 

Thank you again, 

Karyna 

On Jan 10, 2018, at 12:05 AM, wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

Nice to hear from you! 

The next step is you arrange the deposit USD4850, then we start to make the products you 
purchase. When all the goods make out, I take photos to you to see it. And you arrange the 
balance. Then we start to ship it 

By the way, you want us to do the shipping or you find a shipping agent to do the shipping? 

EFTA00540555



Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Website:http://hsruihui.en.alibaba.com 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Date: 2018-01-10 12:13 
To: 
Subject: Re: Outdoor furniture inyloce 
Dear Andy, 

Thank you very much for providing the new quotation. I agree to have 10 all white 
dining sets in order to fill the container. 
I would like to proceed with the purchase. Please advice what should be the next step. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jan 9, 2018, at 1:01 AM, wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

Thank you for your quick reply! 

The dining table set we can make it in white color. And I make an invioce here . Please check 
it. 

Base on the total CBM, I suggest you order 10 sets. If you order 10 dining table sets, it is a MI 
40GP container. 8 dining table sets will waste you about 3 CBM of the container. What do you 
think of it? 

And it is the end of the year now. The delivery time maybe a little late. Once we make out, I 
will inform you to ship it. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Website:http:/ 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Date: 2018.01-09 12:23 
To: -
Subject: Re: White color dining table set 
Dear Andy, 

Thank you for your response. 
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I would like to double the amount of the furniture please, so that the total amount will 
be as follows: 
-1 seat sofa x 40 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric) 
-3 seat sofa x 20 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric) 
-Ottoman x 40 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric) 
-Dining table with chairs x 8 sets (If you could make it fully white that would be best, 
otherwise I will order white frame as on the picture you sent). 

Could you please send the final quotation sheet for the order? 

Thank you very much, 

Karyna 

On Jan 8, 2018, at 2:03 AM, wrote: 

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak 

Nice to hear from you again! 

The sofa size I write in the quotation sheet is suitable. Don't worry. 

And we have the white color frame dining table set. I attached the picture here. Please 
check it. 

By the way, would you like to add I more set dining table set? This order can add I more 
dining table set to rack a full 2011 container CBM. 

Any problem, please feel free to contact me. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Website-littp.//hsniihiii en alihaba com 

From: 
Date: 2018-01-08 14:14 
To: Judy Qin; Andy Ho 
Subject: [Alibaba Reply Notification] Karyna Shuliak has replied you 

u. 
www.Alibaba.com 

Trade Center 

Karyna Shuliak from United States has replied you 
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Reply Now Manage Your Orders 

;:74uKalyna Shuliak 

Hi Judy Qin 

Dear Andy. 

Thank you for your prompt response. 
Could you please verify the dimensions for one seat sofa (chair) and the ottoman (stool). 
One seat sofa dimensiones on the website are listed as 95x83x67, however on the 
quotation sheet it is 85x85x66. Ottoman dimensions on the website are 72x72x33, and on 
the quotation sheet 60x60x43. 
Also, could you please confirm if the dining table with dining chairs are available in white 
color? 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

Latest outdoor patio furniture corner 
sofa design 
1 Seth US $ 

FAQ: 

1. Tips for International Trading  on Alibaba.com 

2. Some top tips for safe trading  on Alibaba.com 

Recent Activity on Alibaba.com:

1. Pipelines for ordering  on Alibaba.com 

Recent new functions and  promotions on Alibaba corn 

Lilian Setting I Customer Services, Win center I .1lv Alibaba

You received this email because you are registered oh Alibaba.com 

US S 

Read our Privacy Policy and Terms of Use 
Alibaba.com Hong Kong Limited. 
26/F Tower One. Times Square. 1 Matheson Street_ Causeway Bay. Hong Kong 
Tel: (+852) 2215-5100 
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