
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Richard Kahn < >, Daphne Wallace

Subject: Artefacto furniture order 

Date: Fri, 06 Apr 2018 17:36:41 +0000 

Attachments: Credit Card Authorization_(2).doc; JSC_101656.pdf; Tenns_and_conditions_High_res.pdf 

Hi Rich and Daphne, 

I am ordering more furniture for the island per Mr. Epstein's instructions. This time is is 6 outdoor chairs and 
side tables from Artefacto. 
Attached below is the invoice including the shipping to the tropical. Trade discount has been applied. 
Rich, can you please process the payment if all looks good to you? The forms for that are attached below. Or, if 
no difference, I can do it with my card? 
Daphne, do you need to give them any shipping instructions? After it arrives to the tropical, we will need you to 
take care of shipping to St. Thomas. 

Thank you! 

Karyna 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Manny
Date: April 6, 2018 at 12:15:16 PM EDT 
To: 'Karyna Shuliak'
Subject: RE: Order updates 

Hi Karyna. 
To approve the order I will need: 

- the order signed - sign anywhere in the bottom 
- The "terms and conditions" form signed 
- The CC auth filled out and signed. 

For any questions or concerns, don't hesitate to contact me. 
Best regards, 

Manny DeSouza 

DESIGN CONSULTANT 
17651 BISCAYNE BLVD 

EFTA00540807



 Original Message 
From: Manny [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, April 06, 2018 12:10 PM 
To: 'Karyna Shuliak' 
Subject: RE: Order updates 

Hi Karyna. 

Please see attached the order with the updated delivery address. 
We do deliver. Please confirm contact name and phone number. 

Thanks, 
Manny. 

 Original Message 
From: Manny [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, April 05, 2018 7:26 PM 
To: 'Karyna Shuliak' 
Subject: RE: Order updates 

Hi Karyna, 
Attached the new order with the ashley outdoor stool. 
Att. 
Manny. 

 Original Message 
From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, April 05, 2018 2:16 PM 
To: 
Subject: Order updates 

Hi Manny, 

I tried calling you, but was told you are busy with a client. 
I would like to add 6 of the white outdoor stools to the order. It is the 
taller one on the picture attached. I believe it is called Ashley? 
Could you please add it to the invoice. 

The address for the tropical shipping is: 
9505 NW 108th Ave 
Medley, FL 33178 
United States 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

EFTA00540808


