
From: Karyna Shuliak < 
To: Carmen Zhang

Subject: Re: St: St: Outdoor furniture order 
Date: Fri, 06 Apr 2018 18:25:30 +0000 

Hi Carmen, 

The color is good. Is this the outdoor fabric? 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Apr 6, 2018, at 7:10 AM, Carmen Zhang 

HI Karyna, 

> wrote: 

Good day. 
For your order, We already produced the frame, But this sofa set, Owing to the beige fabric already out of stock, So can we 
use below similar white color, It is same quality fabric ,If it is ok, Then we can go on production. 
Waiting for your confirmation. 
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Thanks 
Carmen 

MitA: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: 
2018*3) 21 0:34 

aftA: Carmen Zhan < 
OM: Bella Klein < >; Daphne Wallace < >; Richard Kahn 

a: Re: NR: Outdoor furniture order 

Hi Carmen, 

Ok, I understand. Please proceed. 

Thank you. 

On Mar 20, 2018, at 5:10 AM, Carmen Zhang < > wrote: 

HI Karyna, 

Good day. 
We already received the deposit. 
But there are one something I need to update. 

EFTA00540820



For the total amount of 8pcs lounge chair. I just typed 516USD,In fact ,It should be 1032USD,I already correct it, Please 
kindly check the attachment, Sorry for this inconvenience 
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Thanks 
Carmen 

Bella Klein (mailto: 

RAM' zois$31ED.4 21:55 
Wit A: !Canine Shuliak 4

Carmen Zhang 

ita: Re: Outdoor furniture order 

>; Daphne Wallace < >; Richard Kahn 

Carmen, 
Wire transfer was processed, Please confirm when received. 
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