
From: Sarah Kensington 
To: Kim Steube 

Subject: Re: SLK-Dining Rm 
Date: Wed, 02 May 2012 18:46:29 +0000 

No, I didn't get the invite. I'm out of the country at the moment, otherwise would love to stop by. 

On May 2, 2012, at 7:50 PM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Yes I do! I will send it up. Did you get the invite to our party tonight? I hope you can stop by for a drink :) 

KIM STEURE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TII FLOOR 
NFU' MINI( NV Ifl4I ,
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From: Sarah Kensington 
Sent: Wednesday, May 01.1.11 ml
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: SLK-Dining Rm 

Perfect! Please send to 9 E 71st St. Do you also have the original sample from Tai Ping to send with it? 
Thanks.. 

On May 2, 2012, at 7:38 PM, Kim Steube > wrote: 

Hi Sarah, 
Your sample is in! I just tried to calling your cell but your phone isn't going through. 
Where would you like me to send the sample? 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6Th FLOOR 
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From: Richard Kah 
Sent: Tuesday, MarRIPPill 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: Sarah K 
Subject: Re: SLK-Dining Rm 

please review your calculations as they are still incorrect 
please refer to sarah's email that showed my schedule 

EFTA00541342



thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 

On Mar 26, 2012, at 11:03 AM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Hi Sarah, 
I am sorry about the confusion on the 25% payments. This was my error for not explaining our arrangement with my 
assistant Bradford. I have attached the updated price for the dining room and the remaining credit which includes 
the new dining room rug. Please review and let me know if you have any questions. 

Rich- if you have any questions on the balance credit amount, please call me. 

Thank you, 
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