
From: Darren Indyke 

To: 

Subject: Fwd: 9 E 71st ST 

Date: Wed, 09 May 2012 12:49:07 +0000 

Please advise 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Michael Ladenheim" < 
Date: May 8, 2012 6:50:50 PM EDT 
To: "'Darren Indykem 
Subject: RE: 9 E 71st ST 

Darren 
Following up to see if you spoke with yet. 
Thank you 
Mike 

From: Darren Indyke [mailto 
Sent: Friday, May 04, 2012 12:55 PM 
To: Michael Ladenheim 
Subject: Re: 9 E 71st ST 

> 

Should speak to either today or Monday latest and will call back then. Thanks. 

Darren K. Indyke 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC 
301 East 66th Street, 10B 
New York, New York 10065 

email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
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Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
*********************************************************************************************** 

On May 4, 2012, at 12:48 PM, Michael Ladenheim wrote: 

Darren. I am following up to see if you received the break down of charges and also the status of the balance due. 
Please advise. Thank you. Mike 

From: Darren Indyke [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 11:08 AM 
To: MICHAEL LADENHEIM 
Subject: Re: 9 E 71st ST 

Michael, 

Please give me a final accounting of what was paid and what you charged, so I can determine if a balance is 
owed and get it done. The accounting needs to take into account the adjustment for the reduction in the amount 
of material as a result of not doing a diagonal installation. Please let me know asap, so I can finalize. thanks. 

Darren K. Indyke 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC 
301 East 66th Street, 10B 
New York, New York 10065 

email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 

On Apr 11, 2012, at 12:02 PM, MICHAEL LADENHEIM wrote: 

Darren-

Re: 9 E 71st St., NYC 
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The amount of material needed to lay this particular floor straight is 1995 square feet. 
That's a piece of vinyl 12' x 166'3". The square footage needed for this product is greater 
since we need to work with the pattern match, seaming, and with sheet goods that are 12' 
in length. The amount ordered was 2214 sqare feet planning to install on a diagonal. 
Since it did not get installed diagonally, I will adjust the difference of the amount ordered 
to the amount needed. 

The actual net square footage of the apartment is 1325 square feet. We did originally 
quote on installing a vinyl tile, which would have used 1325 square feet. She did 
not opt to use that product. 

As soon as I get word from our distribution on where the new material is I will call you. 

Thank you. 

Michael Ladenheim 
Flooring Liquidators 
270 North Street 
Teterboro, NJ 07608 
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