
From: Colette McGoldrick al la> 

To: = 1. 1
Subject: RE: RE: 

Date: Mon, 21 May 2012 18:07:44 +0000 

Hi=, 

I just had a job put back a few days that we were supposed to do tomorrow so 
we could remove the carpeting in apt # 11P tomorrow and start 8H if that is 
possible. Let me know thanks 

Thanks 

Colette 

 Ori inal Messa e 
From: [mailto:
Sent: Monday, May 21, 2012 12:47 PM 
To: Colette McGoldrick 
Subject: Re: RE: 

So we will have you refinish the floors in 8H first, then we will have it 
painted. We are going to replace the baseboards, so if your men can take off 
the current baseboards prior to refinishing the floors, that would be 
helpful. We want to do the Country White finish in the whole apt, living 
room and bedroom. Can your men start this apt on Wed of this week? 

On May 21, 2012, at 5:04 PM, Colette McGoldrick < IM=1> 
wrote: 

> We can start 8H for you on Monday, if painters are finished but can 
> you find out if they will be as I need to schedule my other work 
> accordingly. I will check with my guys and let you know when we can remove 
carpeting. 

> Thanks 

> Original Message 
> From: I [mailto 
> Sent: Monday, May 21, 2012 10:52 AM 
> To: Colette McGoldrick 
> Subject: 

> Hi Colette, 

EFTA00542398



> We really like the Country white floor sample. 
> One of the studio apts we need to have you refinish, l 1p, has carpet 
> that needs to be pulled up first, then we want to paint the walls, 
> then we will have you refinish the parquet wood floors after the paint job 
is complete. 
> Are your men able to pull up the carpet for us first, or is this 
> something I need to have someone else do? I'm just trying to schedule 
> the painters, but need to know when the carpet can be pulled up first. 
> Also, I'm having a one bedroom, 8H, painted this week, then I will be 
> ready for the floors to be refinished in the Country white in the 
> whole apt and would like to schedule the work for that apt as well. 
> Would it be possible to schedule the start of 8H floors for next week? 

> Thanks for your help! 

EFTA00542399


