
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Karyna Shuliak <MI > 
Cc: Daphne Wallace Bella Klein ‹ > 

Subject: Re: Furniture and statues from Bali to LSJ 
Date: Tue, 08 May 2018 12:52:45 +0000 

please send us open invoices to pay 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On May 8, 2018, at 6:58 AM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

Good morning, 
Please let's have the remaining deposits paid. The vendors keep 
asking me. 
Paola, do you have any updates on the shipping? 
Thank you, 
Karyna 

On May 3, 2018, at 4:43 AM, Karyna Shuliak 
> wrote: 

Good morning to All, 

I have found some furniture and wood statues in Bali, that Mr. 
Epstein would like to order for the island. 
Please note, these are not the kind of stores we would normally 
deal with. It is quite disorganized, prices are negotiated, and 
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sometimes, as I was told by Mr.Epstein, the items might just never 
arrive (hopefully this won't happen). I have done my best to put all 
the information together. I assume the invoices might need to be 
changed. 
Paola, Mr. Epstein would like to to arrange the shipping. Please 
work with Daphne, Bella and Rich on that. 
Please let me know how I can help. 

Thank you very much, 

Karyna 
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