From: Bella Klein </ R -
To: Karyna Shuliak <[ -
Ce: Richard Kahn <| -

Subject: DB LSJE WT Miroku I Gusti Lanang Putra Indonesia 050818 50% deposit backup
Date: Tue, 08 May 2018 17:25:19 0000

Attachments: DB LSJE WT Miroku | Gusti Lanang Putra Indonesia 050818 50% deposit backup.p
df

50% deposit sent by wire

Thank vyou,
Bella

Tel:

Begin forwarded message:

From: premiumbanking.group@db.com
Subject: Outgoing Wire Status Change
Date: May 8, 2018 at 1:16:32 PM EDT
To: ap@hbrkassociates.com

The Haze Trust
Richard Kahn

The status of an outgoing Wire USD Intl One Time for $214.00 from account *9295 changed to Confirmed on
05/08/2018 01:16 PM (ET).

Please do not respond to this e-mail. For more information, sign on to Internet Banking or contact Customer
Support.

EFTA00542855



