
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: payroll 

Date: Wed, 16 May 2018 12:44:48 +0000 

Thank you. 

> On May 16, 2018, at 8:44 AM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

> ok great 
> please let me know if i can help with anything.. 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

>> On May 16, 2018, at 8:40 AM, Karyna Shuliak a wrote: 
>> 
» Hi Rich, 
>> Yes, we went there with Jeanne. The account has been activated. They gave me some checks as well, Jeanne 
was going to order more. I have the instructions at 71st, will try to log in when I am there. 
» Thank you. 

>>> On May 16, 2018, at 8:34 AM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 
>» 
>>> did you on your last visit go to First Bank regarding account 
>>> do you have access to that money via checks or online as your paychecks from LSJ will be direct deposited 
there every 2 weeks 
>» thank you 
>» 
>» Richard Kahn 
>» HBRK Associates Inc. 

>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
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