From: Daphne Wallace {_
To: Karyna Shuliak a_ LSJ GSJ <thesaintjames. groupiagmail .com=

Subject: Re: Furniture from Andy cost
Date: Wed, 27 Jun 2018 17:30:28 +0000
Attachments: Outdoor furniture quotation sheet.xlsx

Greetings Karyna,
Received with thanks. I will complete the Claim forms and forward for review. Kind regards, Daphne

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 11:23 AM Karyna Shuliak fl_ wrote:

EFTA00544702



