
From: Daphne Wallace
To: Ka na Shuliak  LSJ GSJ 

, Rich Kahn
Subject: Re: Furniture from Andy cost 

Date: Wed, 27 Jun 2018 18:18:29 +0000 
Attachments: Claim_Letter Fillable_Form_-_BOL_13171725_-_Heshan_Furniture_damage_-

$539.00.pdf 

Greetings to All, 

Attached is the Claim package for the (5) pieces of furniture discovered to have been damaged in transit. Please 
review. If no objections I will file today. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 12:30 PM Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 
Greetings Karyna, 

Received with thanks. I will complete the Claim forms and forward for review. Kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 11:23 AM Karyna Shuliak < wrote: 

EFTA00544719


