
From: 

To: Stephanie Carroll

Subject: Re: RE: RE: 

Date: Mon, 04 Jun 2012 15:27:14 +0000 

Yes, please proceed in shipping today. I have a new credit card number now cause my old one had fraud. May I 
call to give it to you? Or you call me? 

On Jun 4, 2012, at 4:13 PM, Stephanie Carroll < wrote: 

If they ship today then should receive them Wednesday or Thursday. Shipping to them would be an 
additional $215. Please let me know if you need me to proceed with this and if you would like for me to use the same 
card for the shipping costs? 

Stephanie Carroll 
http://www.dullesglassandmirrorcom 

This communication may contain information that is legally privileged, confidential, or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the 
intended recipient, please note that any review, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is prohibited. Anyone 
receiving this message in error should notify me immediately by telephone or return e-mail at 

and delete/destroy all copies of this message. 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, June 04, 2012 9:56 AM 
To: Stephanie Carroll 
Subject: Re: RE: 

If they ship ti in Miami today, do you know when they will arrive there and if we can can an 

On Jun 4, 2012, at 2:55 PM, Stephanie Carroll < > wrote: 

Good Morning 
Yes, the mirrors are ready to be shipped. Please let me know what you have 
decided on for shipping. 
Thanks! 

Stephanie Carroll 
http://www.dullesglassandmirroncom 

This communication may contain information that is legally privileged, 
confidential, or exempt from disclosure. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please note that any review, dissemination, distribution or 
copying of this communication is prohibited. Anyone receiving this message 
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in error should notify me immediately  by telephone or return e-mail at 
 , and delete/destroy all copies of this 
message. 

 Original Message 
From: K [mailto: 
Sent: Sunday, June 03, 2012 4:41 PM 
To: Stephanie Carroll 
Subject: 

Hi Stephanie, 
Just checking in if my order is ready to ship yet? thanks 
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