
From: 
To: Darren Indyke  

Subject: Fwd: SHIELDS X 40 
Date: Wed, 06 Jun 2012 12:32:50 +0000 

Inline-Images: 12173786031S8tV6jpeg 

wow. it's been almost a year since I've asked to have them made.. we wanted 40 shields, each for $150. We sent a 
check for $1000 despoil... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: Fwd: SHIELDS X 40 
Date: Jul 3, 2011 6:26:53 PM GMT+02:00 
To: 
Cc: 

Dear 
You could send the check directly to me. My address is: 

also works with me and her phone number is (backup). 

I have already sent word to a neighbor of David's in Ambunti to expect an order. 

I do need to make sure you understand that these are not shields. They are panels made from the flattened 
bottom end of a sago palm frond. They are quite light and much more fragile than a wood shield. I would be 
happy to send you, free of charge, an old beat-up (and disposable) panel to confirm that we are all on the 
same page. 
Thanks 

From: IME 
Sent: Wednesday, July 13, 2011 9:13 AM 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: SHIELDS X 40 

HI 
I just wanted to confirm we would like 40 shields made similar to the ones in the photo which are on exhibition at the Metropolitan 
Museum in New York. Brian had sent me some examples of a few shields which a certain "David" had made which my client really liked. 
I am happy to send you a check for $1000 as a deposit. Should I send it directly to you, or should I send it to Brian? Many thanks for 
your help, 

EFTA00545374



Begin forwarded message: 

From: Brian Gaisford 
Date: Jul 12, 2011 10:56:24 AM MDT 
To: ME 
Cc: "Hunt, Dee Anna" 

Subject: Re: SHIELDS X 40 

>, Peter Keller < 

Sahah , 
I am going to put you in direct contact with them . I trust them as they were recommended by very trustworthy friends of mine . 
Send me a chk for $ 1000 dp made out tc 

will get on the order 
Brian 

On Jul 12, 2011, at 12:44 PM, wrote: 

OK, we will do them for $150 each. 

Where is Vista ca? 

On Jul 12, 2011, at 12:00 PM, Brian Gaisford wrote: 

• 

best is $ 150 per but you will have to pay shipping from Vista ca . 

$ 1000 for them . 

PLS advise 

Brian 

EFTA00545375


