
From: 

To: Bella Klein <I 

Subject: Fwd: RE: 

Date: Wed, 06 Jun 2012 18:59:52 +0000 

Attachments: _ 8H_ COUNTRY WHITE BASEBOARD.doc; 
11 P COUNTRf WHITif BASEBOARD.doc 

Hi Bella. Pls find attached 2 invoices for the refinishing of floors in 2 apts. is it possible to please send a check 
for both of these. The work is complete in both. Thankss 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Colette McGoldrick < 
Date: June 1 2012 3:09:26 PM GMT+02:00
To: 
Subject: RE: 

Hi=, 

Attached are the 2 invoices for 8H and 11P. We should be completely finished 
the apts today. 

Thanks 

Colette 

Orignaessage 
From: amailto 
Sent: Friday, June 01, 2012 8:54 AM 
To: Colette McGoldrick 
Subject: 

Hi Colette, 
Can you pls let me know the total cost of the floors with the baseboards for 
both apts 8H and 11P please. I'm just putting together the full budget of 
the apts and need to include this price. thanks very much, 

EFTA00545426


