
From: Karyna Shuliak <E > 
To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: 500 credit from Quality Bath 
Date: Fri, 06 Jul 2018 19:33:35 +0000 

Just spoke to them. They said we should only see $8000 charge from them by now, the rest will be charged later 
when they ship the other part of the order. 
Could you please confirm if they only charged $8000 ? 
Thank you. 

> On Jul 6, 2018, at 1:07 PM, Bella Klein < la> wrote: 

> Still did not receive credit 

> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> Tel: 
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