From: Karyna Shuliak - _
To: Avi Weber <| . -

Subject: Re: Please get back to me!
Date: Fri, 06 Jul 2018 20:51:43 +0000

Hi Avi,
Confirming, everything is correct. We have S8000 charge at the moment as you said.
Thank you.

Karyna

On Jul 6, 2018, at 3:30 PM, Avi Weber *_ wrote:

Please let me know what your accountant says and if everything is ok or if there's still a discrepancy.

Sincerely,

Avi Weber

Sales

Direct Line: /32-534-8861

Toll Free: 1-800-554-3210 x127

email: I
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