From: Debra Braziel <

To: 'Daphne Wallace' <

>, LSJ GST <[ - < :ryna
Shuliak <

Subject: RE: LSJE, LLC - Rugs from Legacy Rug Company - July 19, 2018
Date: Thu, 19 Jul 2018 18:09:20 +0000

Thank you Daphne,

Regards, Debra

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto: ||| GG

Sent: Thursday, July 19, 2018 2:58 PM

To: Debra Braziel < LS/ G! < ; <2ryna Shuliak
< -

Subject: LSJE, LLC - Rugs from Legacy Rug Company - July 15, 2018

Notice: This email ariginated from outside the TSC network.

Greetings Debra,

As discussed, please find the Legacy Rug Company invoice 67 for the 4 area rugs for LSJE, LLC that are being received
today at the warehouse.

Please sail if cleared on Wednesday, 7/25.
Please insure for the sail.

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne

EFTA00545699



