From: Bella Klein <] -
To:

< s

Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / DEVIS WINDOFF
Date: Mon, 18 Jun 2012 21:08:17 +0000

Ms Experton,

[ am awaiting for the summary of the quotes in english.

Please advise how many windows will be changed and what rooms?
Have to submeet for JE approval with all the details.

Thank vou

Bella

On Jun 15, 2012, at 10:38 AM, Marie-Joseph Experton wrote:

Yes, the gquote indicates:

B EMISE QUANTITATIVE ACCORDEE -1 5% DEIL INCLUSE DANS LE MONTANT TOTAL Cf DESSUS
PROMOTION VALABLE POUR COMMANDE PASSEE Avant LE 22 guav 2002 soir 1 3% sUPPLEMENTAIRE DEJA INCLUS DANS LE
MONTANT TOTAL TTC PRiX ARRETE 4 - 14 062 31 € TT C posE

which means that if order is made before June 229 (1 assume with first payment made) the rebate of 15% will be
maintained until then, otherwise the quote will be readjusted.

The work will be done within 12 weeks (approximately) after order made.
Best regards.

Marie-Joseph Experton
Avocar au Barveau de Pavis établi g Bruxelles
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From: I [mailto: |

Sent: vendredi 15 juin 2012 15:59
To: Bella Klein

cc: Rich Kahn; |

Subject: Fwd: DEVIS N®

B cuessing Valdson is saying if we order the windows before Jun 20th, we get a 15% discount, but not if we
order after June 20th? Is this correct Mdm. Experton?
Have the gquotes been sent to JE yet for approval?

Begin forwarded message:

EFTA00546164



From: valdson cotrin <| -

Subject: Fwd: DEVIS N°
Date: June 15, 2012 12:40:03 PM GMT+02:00

To: Sarah K <>

hi sarah.

ist juste for vou memory. windous price mr aproved befoore juin 20 reves 15 % reduced after juin 20 not moore
reduced. obs in kasse aproved need 12 weks for changed.

valdson

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: valdson cotrin =
Date: 2012/6/11

Subject: Fwd: DEVIS N*

To - I . I 511 Kcin <

hi sarah.
only windows.not protetions not peints finition.

---—mmm-- Forwarded message ---—--——--
From: . WINDOFF
Date: 2012/6/11

Subject: DEVIS N®
To: IR

Monsieur,

je fais suite 4 notre conversation téléphonique de ce jour, et vous prie de bien vouloir trouver ci-joint le devis
N° VAPS8 28922 001.

Il va vous parvenir également par courrier.

Wous en souhaitant bonne réception,

Cordialement,
Elodie Berchotteau

Société WindolT
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