
From: Bonnie Gangel 

To: Karyna Shuliak 

Subject: RE: fabric order JSC interiors 

Date: Mon, 13 Aug 2018 15:02:15 +0000 

Attachments: Payment-Authorization-Form.pdf 

Inline-Images: image001.png 

Morning 
In stock at the MILL. So about 2 week lead time from firm order, full payment. 
When ready please advise ship to info, sidemark and give payment, im attachting a credit card authorization form. 
Let me know if you have any questions 

From: Karyna Shuliak [ 
Sent: Friday, August 10, 2018 5:08 PM 
To: Bonnie Gangel 
Subject: fabric order JSC interiors 

Dear Bonnie, 

This is Karyna from JSC interiors. You helped me about a month ago with the fabrics in your showroom. Our 
account # is 10183179 
I would like to order 60 yards of white fabric # 4402-101 (photo attached). 
Could you please check the stock and advice how shall we proceed? 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 
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------------------------------ This e-mail communication and any attachments may contain confidential and 
privileged information and is for use by the designated addressee(s) named above only. Any files transmitted 
with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. Any views or 
opinions presented are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of Kravet Inc. If you are 
not the intended addressee, you are hereby notified that you have received this communication in error and that 
any use or reproduction of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by replying to this message and deleting it 
from your computer. We collect and use your information in accordance with the terms of our Privacy. 
Policy. Thank you. Kravet Inc. 225 Central Ave South, Bethpage NY, 11714' 
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