
From: Bella Klein 
To: Karyna Shuliak SMMIIMMI= 
Cc: Richard Kahn cz 

Subject: Re: Deposit 
Date: Mon, 13 Aug 2018 17:59:57 +0000 

Attachments: artefacti-_credit_card_authorizationt deposit_20k-_081318.pdf 

Credit card authorization form is attached. 

Thank you, 

Bella 

> On Aug 13, 2018, at 1:28 PM, Karyna Shuliak < • wrote: 

> Good afternoon Ezequiel, 

> Thank you very much for your time today. 
> Our colleagues, Bella and Richard are copied on this email. They will send you the deposit form. 
> I will await for the details from you to organize your trip to the island. 

> Thank you very much! 

> Karyna 

EFTA00546921


