
From: "Molly S. Roberg"
To: brice gordon

Cc: Karyna Shuliak

Subject: RE: Artistic Tile Thassos 

Date: Fri, 17 Aug 2018 13:07:20 +0000 
Attachments: 579909 _JSC.pdf 
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Hi Brice, 

Please see attached. I noted the origin and the HTS code also. 
Let me know if you need anything else. 

Thanks, 
Molly 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 

LA lot lit
For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at 

From: [mai Ito 
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 4:24 PM 
To: Molly S. Roberg < 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Artistic Tile Thassos 

Yes 
Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 16, 2018, at 3:28 PM, Molly S. Roberg < 

Hi Brice, 

Yes, of course. I'll send a copy of the order once accounting applies the payment. 
Can we go ahead and ship? 

> wrote: 

or 
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Thanks so much I 

<imagc001  pog> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York. NY 10155 

<image002.pnr<image003 png><image004.pngximage005 png><image006.png> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at or 

From: brice gordon [mailtoi 
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 1:36 PM 
To: Molly S. Roberg 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Artistic Tile Thassos 

Good afternoon Molly 

Payment has been processed 
Would it be possible to country of origin added to invoice 
It is a Customs requirement for all shipments to the USVI 

regards Brice 

On Thu, Aug 16, 2018 at 12:33 PM, Molly S. Roberg < wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 

Please see attached quote for your review. Based on today's inventory we have stock. Payment will secure materials. 
If all looks ok and you're ready to move forward I've attached a payment link below in the amount of $2,477.19. The 
link will get you to the charge/credit card approval for sales order 579909. 
Any questions let me know. 

Here's Link: https://quickclick.com/r/iwc77 

Thank you, 
Molly 

Simagt(Xthpne 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 
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Artistic Tile Inc 
150 East 58th Street. 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 

<image002.pngximage003 pngximage004.pnr<image005 png><image006.png> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at Or 

From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 10:38 AM 

To: Molly S. Rober> 
Cc: brice gordon 
Subject: Re: Artistic Tile Thassos 

Hi Molly, 

Confirming the size of the thassos tile we need is 18"x18" square. 50 square feet total. 
Could you please check the stock and let us know the lead time? 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

On Aug 15, 2018, at 5:35 PM, Molly S. Roberg

Hi Karyna, 

> wrote: 

Please see attached Thassos DSP noting the available sizes we stock. If you don't see a size that will work we can cut 
into smaller scale tile. As long as material is available lead time for custom cuts is approx. 2-3 weeks. Please advise 
the size and I'll send quote and availability. 

Thanks, 
Molly 

<image001.png> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 

<image002.png>cimage003.png><image004.wg><image005.png><image006 png> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at or 
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From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2018 1:36 PM 
To: Molly S. Roberg 
Cc: brice gordon
Subject: Re: Artistic Tile Thassos 

Good afternoon Molly, 

We would like to order 50 square feet of the white thassos tile, that you gave me a sample of (picture below). 
Could you please kindly let me know if you have it in stock and what would be the lead time? It would go to 
the same address as the shower tiles we ordered from you earlier. 
My colleague Brice, who is managing this project is copied on this email and will work with you on this 
order. I am not sure if 12"x12" configuration would work or if we need a different size, Brice could you 
please advice on that part? 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

<image007.jpg><image008.jpg> 

On Aug 9, 2018, at 11:43 PM, Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

Hi Molly, 

Thank you very much for the photos. 
Will see how if the sample works. 

Best regards, 

Karyna 

On Aug 9, 2018, at 5:25 PM, Molly S. Roberg < > wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 

Nice seeing you yesterday. We carry two grades of Thassos Polished Al Select (cleanest) and A2 Standard. We 
carry Al in various field sizes which can be seen in the DSP attached. We carry Thassos A2 in 12x24. 

I've attached two lot photos for your review. Thassos Al Select Lot 071718 and Thassos A2 Lot 37333 

If you have a photo of your client's bathroom I'm happy to look at it to see if I can identify the stone being used. 

Feel free to contact me with any questions. 
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Thanks, 
Molly 

<imagg001  png> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc 
150 East 58th Street. 9th Floor. New York. NY 10155 
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For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at Or 

<STHA1P1224 071718 (1).JPG><STHA2P1224 37333 (1).JPG><DSP-Thassos.pdf> 
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Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USV1 

Ph: 
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