From: Richard Kahn H—
To: Karyna Shuliak -
Ce: Daphne Wallace —

Subject: Re: Artefacto Order - Dining chairs St Thomas
Date: Tue, 21 Aug 2018 21:24:02 +0000

thank you
involce was never attached..
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa

co

On Aug 21, 2018, at 5:23 PM, Karyna Shuliak *_'-“-* wrote:

Hi Rich,
yes, the invoice was part of the emails, maybe it didn’t go through, I will send it to you again.
Artefacto store that we are working with 1s in Aventura, Fl (near Miami)

Thank you.

On Aug 21, 2018, at 3:49 PM, Richard Kahn *_> wrote:

do you have invoice for dining room chairs? dimensions?
also do we know where they are located in FL?

please advise

thanks

Richard Kahn

HBERK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

fa

cell [N
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On Aug 21, 2018, at 12:31 PM, Karyna Shuliak _'-“-* wrote:
Hello to All,

Forwarded below is the order for 6 dining chairs for LS.

Ezequiel, Manny, our team 15 included on this email. Could you please kindly include them in any
communication containing the actual orders, payment or shipping details.

Rich, could vou please review and sign sales order and terms and conditions.

Daphne, could you please confirm if the shipping should go through the Tropical?

Thank you very much!

Karyna

Begin forwarded message:

From: Ezequie! <[ -

Subject: RE: Artefacto Order - Dining chairs St Thomas
Date: August 21, 2018 at 11:26:23 AM EDT

To: 'Karyna Shuliak' < >

Cc:

sorry, didn't attached. Here it goes.

Thank you,
Ezequiel

From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: ||

Sent: Tuesday, August 21, 2018 11:19 AM

To: Ezequiel
cc: IR

Subject: Re: Artefacto Order - Dining chairs 5t Thomas
Good moming Ezequiel,
Shall I just sign on the mnvoice or 15 there supposed to be another attachment?

Thank vou,

Karyna

On Aug 21, 2018, at 10:47 AM, Ezequiel {_ wrote:

Hello Karyna,

Please find attached the 50 for the 6 Armless Chairs for the island. Please sign the Sales Order and Terms and
Conditions and send them back to us.
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Also confirm if this will be ship to "Tropical Shipping” warehouse in Medley, FL.
In a separated email will send the items for Palm Beach house.
Any guestions, don't hesitate to contact us.

Regards,
EZEQUIEL

Interior Design Consultant

artefacto

17451 Biscayne Blvd
Aventura, FL 33180
PI
f

www.artefacto.com

<Order Stock Dining chair.pdf==California Armless Chair White_ jpg=

<TERMS & CONDITIONS.pdf>
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