From: Richard Kahn <||| R

=, Daphne Wallace

To: ‘umnny _

Ce: ; g

Subject: Re: Artefacto - Sales Order Palm Beach
Date: Thu, 23 Aug 2018 18:31:42 +0000

Maniny

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 LLx:ln-.___lon Avenue 4th Floor
22

On Aug 23, 2018, at 1:49 PM, Manny f_-} wrote:

Hi Richard,

Attached the updated orders with the adjusted delivery charge as requested.

Please sign them both and send back asap.

Also attached the CC authorization form, please fill them out,

For any other guestions or concerns, don’t hesitate to contact me.

Best regards,

Manny DeSouza

DESIGN C U."\.hl..l_].‘\f\]

[T651 BISLY 1)
PHONE
FAX

WWWARTEFACTO.COM

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: |

Sent: Wednesday, August 22, 2018 3:21 PM

sign and send back asap.

EFTA00547543



To: Manny

cc: Ezequiel; || &<z Kiein; Daphne Wallace
Subject: Re: Artefacto - Sales Order Palm Beach

attached are signed terms and conditions for all 3 orders

please review your shipping costs for 2 Palm Beach orders as 706.07 and 1,923,158 totaling 2,629.25 seems
very high to deliver within Florida (less than 75 miles apart)

1 am proposing 400 and 1,000 for a total reduction of 1,249.25 which seems very reasonable on orders totaling
$50,000++

once shipping is adjusted bella will call to pay for the 2 Florida purchase orders:

daphne will call to pay for LSJE LLC order immediately and will also give you location for delivery
thank you

LSJE LLC
purchase order 105169/55 - 6 dining room chairs $2,218.97

<JSC 105042.pdf=<JSC 105183 . pdf=<Credit Card Authorization (2).doc><Credit Card Authorization (2).doc>

EFTA00547544



