
From: Seth Pariser

To: Daphne Wallace

Cc: Karyna Shuliak <karynashuliak®icloud.com>, Bella Klein < 

Subject: RE: LSJ kitchen fabric 

Date: Wed, 03 Oct 2018 20:33:40 +0000 

Also, just double checking that FedEx acct. is 2296-5782-0. 

The system was telling me not an active account in database. It could be wrong maybe, but I thought I would double 
check. 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Pchristopherhylandinc 

From: Seth Pariser 
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 4:28 PM 
To: 'Daphne Wallace' 
Cc: 'Karyna Shuliak'; 'Bella Klein' 
Subject: RE: LSJ kitchen fabric 

Let me rephrase, what is the tax id # for LSJE, LLC please? 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
OchrIstooherhylandinc 

From: Seth Pariser 
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 4:28 PM 
To: 'Daphne Wallace' 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: RE: LSJ kitchen fabric 

/ www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram 

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram 

What is your tax id # please? 

EFTA00548472



Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Pchristopherhylandinc 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 2:48 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS) kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram 

I contacted FedEx, and gave them the 320 cm dimension. They assured me that the fabric can be shipped from 
NY to St. Thomas via FedEx freight. It should take 3-5 days. 

Email me a copy of the paperwork once it is ready and I will follow up with Fedex. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Oct 3, 2018 at 1:11 PM Seth Pariser < > wrote: 

Hello Daphne and Karyna, 

If all goes well, the shipment may be available as early as Tuesday for pickup from FedEx. 

As I will be out of the office traveling for work next week, I am trying to set up as much as possible at this time. 

Has FedEx confirmed that they will be able to collect this oversized shipment or do they offer an alternative freight 
service that has to be used? 

Please confirm soonest you know so I can at least get the paperwork prepared in advance of my departure. 

Many thanks. 

Best, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram 
pchristopherhylandinc 

EFTA00548473



From: Daphne Wallace [mailto 
Sent: Monday, October 01, 2018 5:19 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS] kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

We are happy to hear that the shipping logistics worked out. We will take care of payment, and notify Fedex 
of this upcoming shipment. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Mon, Oct 1, 2018 at 4:05 PM Seth Pariser < > wrote: 

Hi Daphne, 

This week, a special shipment is being organized through DHL Global Freight Forwarders to collect and ship the two 
oversized packages that make up this order to our local warehouse. 

The additional S&H fee is $625. I have added this to the original bill and I kindly ask that you please remit this new 
amount. 

If all goes well, next week we should have the order delivered in to our warehouse. 

For final shipping which will be done using your Federal Express account, please be in touch with FedEx to let them 
know that the packages will be exceeding 300 cm long and that they can ship to the USVI. 

The pickup zip code from Glendale, Queens is 11385. 

Many thanks. 

My best, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Instagram pchristopherhylandinc

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on 

From: Karyna Shullak [mallto:karynashullak@icloud.com 
Sent: Thursday, September 27, 2018 1:20 PM 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Seth Pariser; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LSJ kitchen fabric 

EFTA00548474



Hi Daphne, 

Thank you very much for the update! 

All the best, 

Karyna 

On Sep 27, 2018, at 12:48 PM, Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 

Greetings Karyna, 

Just to let you know and keep you in the loop, Seth is currently investigating another option for shipping 
the kitchen banquette fabric from Italy to his warehouse in Queens. 

The fabric is 118" wide. The upholster and the manufacturer both agree that the fabric cannot be folded. 
Seth cannot use our Fedex account to ship the fabric from Italy to NY. The fabric must be received by 
Seth first before it is released to us. We brainstormed all these options :) 

Seth will let us know what the next steps are, and we will update everyone as we progress. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 11:02 AM Seth Pariser < > wrote: 

Thank you Daphne. 

I will take care of all and let you know tracking once I have it. 

Best, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Instagram pchristopherhylandinc

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 11:58 AM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS] kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on 

We would like the fabric sent to us via Federal Express. 

EFTA00548475



Please use our account: 2296-2846-1 

Send to: 

LSJE, LLC 
6100 Red Hook Quarter B3 
St. Thomas, USVI 00802-1348 

Contact Number: 340-775-2525 
Contact Person: Daphne Wallace 

Please email us the tracking number once the package is picked up and we will track it on our end as 
well. 

Please do not hesitate to email or contact me at 340-775-2525 if you have any questions or concerns. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 10:40 AM Seth Pariser < > wrote: 

Good morning. 

The fabric is expected to arrive by the end of this week if all goes well. 

I await your further shipping instructions. 

Kind regards, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
0 & 0 Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Instagram pchristopherhylandinc 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 10:35 AM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS.1 kitchen fabric 

/ www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on 

Greetings Seth, 

We are just touching base it see if you have an updated EDA for the fabric. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Sep 12, 2018 at 3:25 PM Seth Pariser > wrote: 

EFTA00548476



Okay I will be in touch when it arrives. 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
on Instagram Pchristopherhylandinc

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 4:05 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: IS) kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

We were wondering about changing back to having you Fedex the fabric to us rather than sending it 
to Florida to the ocean carrier. 

When you receive the fabric and have packaged it to ship, can you email us the measurements? 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Sep 12, 2018 at 3:00 PM Seth Pariser > wrote: 

Are you asking me to hold it before I send to LSJE Shipping in Florida? 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
0 & 0 Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
us on Instagram 9christopherhylandinc 

/ / www.christopherhyland.com / Follow 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 11:30 AM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS] kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

Thank you so much for the update. Please email us once you receive, before it is shipped out. 

EFTA00548477



Kind regards Daphne 

On Wed, Sep 12, 2018, 11:25 AM Seth Pariser < 

Hi Daphne, 

> wrote: 

This is expected to come out of production within the next 10 days and ship thereafter (apprx. 1 week 
for that). 

Kind regards, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D& D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Follow us on Instagram @christopherhylandinc 

From: Daphne Wallace [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 10:03 AM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS3 kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

/ www.christopherhyland.com / 

I am checking on the status of the arrival of the JSC Interiors order (#14165), as you estimated 
9/10-9/15/18 for arrival. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 4:48 PM Seth Pariser

Noted on all 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 

& D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
Follow us on Instagram Pchristopherhylandinc

> wrote: 

/ www.christopherhyland.com / 

From: Daphne Wallace (mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 4:34 PM 

EFTA00548478



To: Seth Pariser 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: LS) kitchen fabric 

Greetings Seth, 

When the order is ready, we would like it shipped to our ocean carrier in Florida: 

LSJE, LLC - ST. THOMAS 
Tropical Shipping 
9505 NW 108th Avenue 
Medley, FL 33178 

Customer service: 561-881-3999 
Hours of operation: 8 am - 4 pm (the receiving department will sign for the delivery) 

Since the fabric is being shipped via ocean carrier instead of air, we are kindly asking that 
the fabric be double wrapped if it is not boxed. 

Please do not hesitate to email or contact me at 340-775-2525 if you have any questions. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 1:42 PM Seth Pariser < > wrote: 

We can ship anywhere, but it was Bella who indicated that FedEx Int'l shipping into the USVI can 
sometimes be tricky, so she thought it better to send to your freight consolidator in Florida. 

We will do what is easiest for you. 

From: Karyna Shuliak [mallto:karynashuliak@icloud.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 2:36 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Cc: Daphne Wallace; Seth Pariser 
Subject: Re: LS) kitchen fabric 

Seth said he can have it shipped directly to St. Thomas 

On Jul 25, 2018, at 2:24 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Daphne, 
I believe fedex should go to Tropical not to VI. Please confirm 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 212-971-1307 

On Jul 25, 2018, at 3:13 PM, Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 

Greetings Seth, 

EFTA00548479



The LSJE, LLC Federal Express account is 2296-5782-0. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 1:06 PM Karyna Shuliak <karynashuliak@icloud.com>
wrote: 

Good afternoon Bella, Daphne and Seth, 

Seth and I were working on the fabric order for LSJ kitchen banquet. I forwarded 
below Seth's email with the final invoice and the credit card form. 
Please review for accuracy. If all is correct, Bella could you please process the 
payment? 
Daphne, could you please send our Fedex account to Seth, so that he can have it 
shipped directly to St. Thomas? Also, in case you need, the country of origin is Italy. 

Thank you all very much! 

Karyna 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Seth Pariser 
Date: July 25, 2018 at 12:40:09 PM EDT 
To: Karyna Shuliak <larynashuliak@icloud.com>
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein order 

Hi Karyna, 

Yes it is. 

Quote revised. 

Please include a contact person and tel. phone number for LSJE. 

Also, please advise your FedEx acct. for shipping the order to USVI on. 

Thank you, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
www.christopherhyland.com/ Follow us on Instagram OchrIstopherhylandinc 

EFTA00548480



From: Karyna Shuliak maittotarynashuliakeicloud.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 12:31 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein order 

Good afternoon Seth, 

The revised amount of fabric for the order is 40 yards. 
Ship to: 
LSJE, LLC 
6100 Red Hook Quarters, suite B-3 
St. Thomas, USVI 00802 

Could you please adjust the quote given the above. 

Also, just want to check if the country of origin is Italy? We would need to know it 
for the customs. 

Once I have your invoice, I will put you in touch with two of my colleagues who 
will take care of the payment. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

On Jul 24, 2018, at 5:24 PM, Seth Pariser 

Tomorrow is a new day Karyna. 

Have a nice evening. 

Regards, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

T: 
/ www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us 

on InstagramPchristopherhylandinc 

wrote: 

From: Karyna Shullak [maiRolcarynashullakekloud.com]
Sent Tuesday, July 24, 2018 4:40 PM 

EFTA00548481



To: Seth Pariser 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein order 

Hi Seth, 

I am still waiting for the answer on the correct amount of fabric. I assume we will 
not be able to process the order today, hopefully tomorrow. 
Sony for the delay. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jul 24, 2018, at 12:50 PM, Seth Pariser < 

Hi Karyna, 

Here is the information for now. 

wrote: 

Please confirm that in ordering 60 yards, you realize the width of the fabric is 118 
Inches. 

My best, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 
Senior Vice President 
Christopher Hyland Incorporated 
D & D Building 
979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 
New York, NY 10022 

/ www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us 
on Instagram @christopherhylandinc 

From: Karyna Shullak [ 

EFTA00548482


