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Thank you. This will ship tomorrow, and we will provide a UPS number in the afternoon.
Have a nice evening.

Best regards,
Kim Batarse

SITRAM USA

On Oct 14, 2018, at 2:50 PM, Karyna Shuliak fi_vmm:

Hello,
Yes, that would be acceptable.
Thank vou very much.

Karyna

On Oct 14, 2018, at 5:31 PM, Sitram USA _ wrote:

Hello,

Thank you for your order.

We are out of stock on the 1 1/2 Qt. s 1t acceptable if we ship the 2 Qt 712015 in place of the 1 1/2 Ot

without a change in price? The other skus are immediately available.

The HORECA R lines 1s getting great reviews, and we are confident vou will be pleased.
Please let us know 1f this acceptable.

Thank vou,

Kim Batarse
Sitram USA

Sent from my iPhone

EFTA00548822



On Oct 14, 2018, at 9:50 AM, Sitram USA | Culinary Habana _ wrote:

|, Sitram USA

New customer order

You have received an order from Karyna Shuliak. The order is as follows:

Order #4146 (October 14, 2018)

Product Quantity

Stainless Steel Saucepan -
Horeca- R - 712013/ 24cm 9 1
1/2"1 5.4 Qt (#712013)

Stainless Steel Saucepan -
Horeca- R - 712030 / 28 cm 11"/ 1
8.8 Qt (#712030)

Stainless Steel Saucepan -
Horeca- R - 712014 / 14 cm 5.5" 1
/1 Qt (#712014)

Subtotal:

Shipping:

Payment method:

Total:

Price

$72.00

$84.00

$42.00

$241.50

$13.00 via Flat
rate Shipping Fee

Credit card
(Square)

$254.50

EFTA00548823



Product Quantity

Stainless Steel Saucepan -
Horeca - R - 712029 / 16cm 6.3" / 1
1.5 Qt (#712029)

Subtotal:

Shipping:

Payment method:

Total:

Billing address

Karyna Shuliak
JSC interiors, LLC
O E 71st Street
n/a n/a
New York, NY 10021

<invoice-100 201516100 01.pdf=

Karyna Shuliak
JSC interiors, LLC
9 E 71st Street

Price

$43.50

$241.50

$13.00 via Flat

rate Shipping Fee

Credit card
(Square)

$254.50

Shipping address

New York, NY 10021

EFTA00548824



