
From: Karyna Shuliak 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: 240308 JSC Shuliak Library.Pdf 
Date: Wed, 10 Oct 2018 17:56:36 +0000 

Could you please ask her. Not sure if the discount is reflected in the estimate. 
Thank you. 

> On Oct 10, 2018, at 1:33 PM, Richard Kahn <a> wrote: 

> thank you 
> how do we know if their term designer net includes discount? and if so what amount? 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York NY 10022 
> tel 
> fax 
> cell 

>> On Oct 10, 2018, at 1:11 PM, Karyna Shuliak a wrote: 

» Hello Tenzing, 
>> Thank you very much for the samples. We would like to proceed with Astinn white carpet. I attached below 
the estimate that you sent to me the other day. 
>> My colleague Mr. Kahn is copied on this email. He will be working with you on placing this order. 
» Thank you very much, 
» Karyna 

>> <240308 JSC Shuliak Libraty.Pdf> 
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