
From: Ezequiel 

To: 'Ka na Shuliak' ,'Richard Kahn' 

Cc: 

Subject: RE: Sofa for New York 

Date: Mon, 22 Oct 2018 20:55:57 +0000 

Attachments: JSC_-_Sofa_Pravda.pdf; Shipping_JSC_Design.pdf; TERMS_&_CONDITIONS.pdf 

Hello Karyna, 
Here is the sales order for the sofa along with the shipping to New York. 
Sofa have a 25% discount already applied to it. 

All (order and shipping) is cover with the store credit. 

Richard, could you sign all and send it back to us? 

Any questions, don't hesitate to call us. 
Best regards, 
Ezequiel 

 Original Message 
From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, October 17, 2018 11:11 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Ezequiel; 
Subject: Re: Sofa for New York 

Thank you very much! 

> On Oct 17, 2018, at 11:08 AM, Richard Kahn < Ila> 
wrote: 

> ok to apply credit 
> shipping address is 9 east 71st street 
> thank you 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York, NY 10022 

» On Oct 17, 2018, at 10:33 AM, Ezequiel czMIMI > wrote: 
>> 
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» Hello Karina, 

>> We will process the order and send all documents shortly. There is no 
need 
» for payment, there is an available credit (from the umbrellas and rugs 
for 
>> outdoor) that you can use. Woulk you like to apply it to the sofa? 

>> I will need the shipping address to get an estimate for the freight cost. 
>> 
» Thank you, 

» Ezequiel 

>> Original Message 
>> From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: 
>> Sent: Wednesda October 17, 2018 12:16 AM 
» To: 
>> Cc: Richard Kahn 
» Subject: Sofa for New York 

» Hi Ezequiel, 

>> We would like to purchase this sofa (picture attached) in the same color 
and 
>> fabric as displayed in your showroom. Do you still have it in stock? It 
>> would have to be shipped to New York residence. 
>> I have copied my colleague, Mr. Kahn, on this email. He will be 
processing 
» the payment for the order. 

>> Please advice if we can proceed with the purchase. 
>> 
>> Thank you very much! 

• Karyna 
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