
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Payment for the IVP course 

Date: Wed, 24 Oct 2018 21:03:21 +0000 

Thank you Rich! 

> On Oct 24, 2018, at 4:49 PM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

> thank you 
> will be paid tomorrow am 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York, NY 10022 
> tel
> f 
> ce 

>> On Oct 24, 2018, at 3:55 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 
>> 

» Hi Rich, 

>> Jeffrey asked if you could please pay the total of CHF 34'510.00 via bank transfer. Attached below is the 
invoice from the school with the wire instructions. 
>> 

» Thank you very much! 
>> 
» Karyna 
>> 
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