
From: Darren Indyke 
To: Daphne Wallace < F-• 
Cc: 

Subject: Fwd: Ms. 
Date: Tue, 17 Jul 2012 17:47:52 +0000 

Attachments: 

PLEASE NOTE THAT, EFFECTIVE JUNE 5, 2012, MY NEW CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
*********************************************************************************************** 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Lesley Martin" < 
Date: July 17, 2012 1:44:27 PM EDT 
To: "Darren Indyke" < 
Cc: "M." < 
Subject: Fw: Ms. 

Dear Mr. Indyke & 

The three plywood crates left Wewak PNG yesterday on Air Niugini Airway bill # 656-06144714. They are 
addressed to Tropical Shipping address below. On each box there is are three copies of the Invoice and a copy 
of the National Museum Export Permit which are needed to clear customs in Florida. Please give the customs 
clearing people my telephone number, , in case they need assistance with the clearing. 
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Attached is a copy of the Invoice on the box. I am waiting on a copy of the export permit and will forward it as 
soon as I receive it. 

Most of the airfreight for the US goes through Singapore and the boxes would have got to Port Moresby in 
time to catch the once-a-week flight on Monday afternoon. Therefore the boxes should be in Florida this 
week. 

Best 
Lesley 

From: 
Sent: Monday, July 02, 2012 5:46 PM 
To: Lesley Martin 
Cc: Darren Indyke 
Subject: Re: Ms. 

Thank you Lesley. To confirm, the shipping address should be: 
Brice Gordon/LSJ/St. Thomas 

Thank you, 

On Jul 2, 2012, at 8:12 PM, Lesley Martin < > wrote: 

Dear Mr.Indyke and 
I have just had confirmation that the permit to export is being sent from Port Moresby to Wewak to my 
brother today to ship the bark panels. Grace Guise, the permit officer at the PNG National Museum is going 
to send the permits to 
Wewak today. I have asked her to send them TNT to speed them up and I will repay her. If you need 
confirmation for this process please feel free to fax the Museum at 011 to either the Director 
Dr Andrew Moutu or the permit officer Grace V. Guise. The Museum email is not working. Telephone 
numbers for the Museum are however I have not been able to get through on these 
and have only been able to get Grace on her home phone. 
Best 
Lesley Martin 
PS I have put the address of the freight forwarder to be placed on the permit, with your name first. 
Should any other name be on the airway bill? 

From: Darren Indyke 
Sent: Monda June 11 2012 11:34 AM 
To: 
Subject: Ms. 

Dear Ms. Martin: 

Please see the attached letter regarding Pacific Artefacts' breach of your agreement with Ms. 
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Sincerely, 

Darren K. Indyke 

PLEASE NOTE THAT, EFFECTIVE JUNE 5, 2012, MY NEW CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

Telephone: 
Telecopier:
Mobile: 
email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
*********************************************************************************************** 

Dear Ms. Martin: 

Please see the attached letter regarding Pacific Artefacts' breach of your agreement with Ms. 

Sincerely, 

Darren K. Indyke 

PLEASE NOTE THAT, EFFECTIVE JUNE 5, 2012, MY NEW CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS: 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: • 
email: 

******************************************************* ***** ********************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ID 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, nit — All rights reserved. 
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