
From: CARLUZ TOYLO sci 
To: Daphne Wallace ala 

Cc: Rich Kahn  , Visoski< >, 
, Renato 

Subject: Re: RH Order Confirmation - Order #17522528 

Date: Wed, 14 Nov 2018 00:02:23 +0000 

Ok Sure not a problem 

Carluz Toylo 
358 El Brillo way 
Palm Beach, FL. 33480 

On Nov 13, 2018, at 08:06 AM, Daphne Wallace < wrote: 

Greetings Carluz, 

I am presuming that Mr. Epstein has not requested the chair immediately, so you should take it to Tropical Shipping. 
I will edit the RH invoice so it is acceptable for Customs. 

If you take the chair tomorrow, it should sail on Friday, 11/16, EDA on STT by 11/22. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Mon, Nov 12, 2018 at 10:15 AM CARLUZ TOYLO > wrote: 
Hi Daphne , 

Good morning , just received this chair , how do you 
want this ship? Pls advise , thank you 

Carluz Toylo 
358 EL Brillo Way 
Palm Beach , FL 33480 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Karyna Shuliak
Date: November 12, 2018 at 10:11:27 EST 
To: CARLUZ TOYLO 
Cc: Renato PB 
Subject: Re: RH Order Confirmation - Order #17522528 

Thank you. Please coordinate the shipping with Daphne. 

On Nov 12, 2018, at 9:58 AM, CARLUZ TOYLO wrote: 

<image! jpeg> 
Item just received, How do you want this ship? 
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Thank you 

Carluz Toylo 
358 EL Brillo Way 
Palm Beach , FL 33480 

On Nov 10, 2018, at 12:00, 

Hi Carluz and Renato, 
The delivery time frame for Monday is between 9 and I lam. 
Thank you, 
Karyna 

wrote: 

On Nov 9, 2018, at 3:52 PM, CARLUZ TOYLO < > wrote: 

Okay , thank you 

Carluz & Arline Toylo 
358 EL Brillo Way 
Palm Beach , FL 33480 

On Nov 9, 2018, at 14:48, 

Hello Carluz and Renato, 

> wrote: 

FYI, the chair from restoration hardware is scheduled to be delivered on Monday November 12th. 
They should call me on Saturday to provide a time frame. I will let you know. 

Thank you! 

Karyna 

On Nov 1, 2018, at 4:43 PM, Daphne Wallace <I 

Greetings Karyna, 

Received with thanks. Kind regards, Daphne 

On Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 5:45 PM Karyna Shuliak

Hello to All, 

> wrote: 

wrote: 

Please see below the invoice from Restoration Hardware. 
The chair is designated for LSJ master bathroom. 
It will be delivered to Palm Beach between Nov.10th to 17th. 
Carluz, they have yours and my cell phone number on file to confirm the delivery. This will need to go 
to LSJ. Please coordinate with Daphne what would be the best time and way to ship it, taking into 
account other items we might have. 
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Daphne, I have requested for the country of manufacture, material and price to be reflected in the 
invoice inside the package. 

Thank you very much! 
Please let me know if you have any questions. 

All the best, 

Karyna 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: RH
Date: November 1, 2018 at 5:38:16 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: RH Order Confirmation - Order #17522528 

__.RH 

ORDER CONFIRMATION 

I ORDER #17522528 

Dear Karyna Shuliak, 

Thank you for shopping at RH. Your order for the following items has been placed. 

SHIPPING 

KARYNA SHULIAK 

358 El Brillo Way 

Palm Beach, FL 33480-4730 

United States 

BILLING 

KARYNA SHULIAK 

9 E 71st St 

New York, NY 10021-4102 

United States 

GALLERY 

Designed/Sold by Andrea K. 

RH West Palm, The Gallery at 

CityPlace 

560 Okeechobee Blvd., West Palm 

Beach, FL 33401 

Hours Sunday llam-7pm, Monday -

Saturday 10am-8pm 

PRICE QTY TOTAL 
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LUKE SWIVEL CHAIR $2,621.00 

ITEM # 69790775 BWWT 
FABRIC 
Perennials Performance Textured Linen Weave 
COLOR White 
FINISH Polished Chrome 

AVAILABILITY 

This item will be ready for 
delivery between 11/08/18 
and 11/15/18. 

IMPORTANT INFORMATION 

All prices shown are in US dollars. 

As you specified, furniture items will be delivered 
as they are available. If you would prefer to have 
items grouped into as few deliveries as possible, 
please call Customer Service at 800.762.1005. 

For additional order details, visit your account 

Want to be in the know? Sign up for email.. 

Visit Us at the Gallery Nearest You 

DELIVERY 

Unlimited Furniture 
Delivery ► 

ORDER TOTAL 

1 $2,621.00 

RETURNS 

This item can be 
returned. Learn 
more about our 
Return Policy ► 

SUBTOTAL 
HANDLING & 
PERSONALIZATIO 
N 
SALES TAX FOR 
33480-4730 
TOTAL 
MEMBER 
SAVINGS 

$2,621.00 

$199.00 
$197.40 

$3,017.40 
$874.00 

RH MEMBERS PROGRAM I PRIVACY POLICY I FREQUENTLY ASKED QUESTIONS I CONTACT US I CUSTOMER SERVICE 

g; 2018 RH 15 Koch Road, Corte Madera, CA 94925 
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