
From: 
To: Bella Klein <I 

Cc: Rich Kahn -4 
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Devis fenetres 

Date: Thu, 19 Jul 2012 14:23:26 +0000 

FYI.. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Devis fenetres 
Date:  18,  2012 11:21:12 AM EDT 
To: 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

I just spoke with Mr. from Windoff who sent you the total price for the windows. 
He told me that discount was already made 15% and discussed with the brazilian guy who works at your place. 
Unfortunately, he cant do better discount because your windows are very big and you need special wood and 
support for it. 
I told him i will call him back if you need me to ask him something else 

Best regards, 

GSM 
GSM 
E-mail: 

17 juil. 2012, e 18:22, eanmcan(a): 

The measurements should be on the attached quote with the breakdown of work.. Did you receive the 
attachment on my first email? It's all in French, so I can't understand quite what is says, but it should give 
dimensions, etc.. 

On Jul 17, 2012, at 10:24 AM, wrote: 

Do you have other details, its extremely expensive 
Do you have measurements or they official Devis? Its not devis its just prices 

Best regards, 
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GSM +{ 

GSM +{ 

E-mail: 

Hat1HCall: 

HI ! I hope you are well! Jeffrey needs some windows replaced in his Paris apt and we have 
received the attached quote. Jeffrey is asking if you could help negotiate the price for us? The company is 
called WINDOFF, and all the relevant information is attached in the quote. Please let me know if you can 
help with this. Thank you and hope to see you soon! 
Best, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN I Devis fenetres 
Date: July 16, 2012 2:50:14 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: 

have negotiate. 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Jul 16, 2012 at 2:37 PM 
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Devis feifetres 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Bella Klein <I 
Date: July 16, 2012 2:30:41 PM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Cc: Rich Kahn < >, 
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Devis fenetres 

Attached, please find new quote from WINDOFF for 5 windows in Paris apartment. Total cost with 
VAT: 32,595E if order made before July 22nd. 
(Cost of labor is 6,519.12E. Cost of materials is 26,076.48E) . 

13,033.24E: down payment to be paid when order is made (before or on July 22nd!). 
19,557.36E: outstanding balance to be paid when work is done. 

Please advise. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton  
Date: July 10, 2012 6:12:50 PM EDT 
To: 'Bella Klein' < 
Cc: 'Richard Kahn' < 
Subject: EPSTEIN / Devis fenetres 
Reply-To: 

New quote received from WINDOFF for 5 windows (kitchen / study / sitting room Chalgrin) as 
requested by Mr. Epstein. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

Avoca! au Barreau de Paris etabli a Bruxelles 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton [malt) 
Sent: vendredi 29 juin 2012 18:12 
To: 'Bella Klein' 
Cc: 'Richard Kahn' 
Subject: EPSTEIN / Devis fenetres 
Importance: High 
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Mr Epstein met the people from WINDOFF for the windows repair, who are due to submit new quotes 
(likely to be next week). I will inform you as soon as received. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

Avocet au Barreau de Paris etabli a Bruxelles 

 Original Message 

From: Bella Klein [mailto: 

Sent: vendredi 29 juin 2012 16:03 

To: Marie J Experton 

Subject: 

Did you receive any updates on windows repair from Valdson? 

Thank you 

Bella 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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