
From: Daphne Wallace
To: Karyna Shuliak 

Cc: Rich Kahn < >, 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

Date: Wed, 05 Dec 2018 20:28:02 +0000 
Attachments: STARK_-_QUOTE_253970_-_$17,587.60_-_December_5,_2018.pdf 

Greetings Tenzing, 

Attached please find the signed credit card authorization for JSC Interiors Quote 253970. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 10:38 AM Karyna Shuliak < > wrote: 

Good morning Tenzing, Daphne and Rich, 

Please see below the estimate for the rug from Tenzing. 
Rich, could you please work with Tenzing on the payment. 
Daphne, if you could please coordinate with Tenzing the shipping process to St.Thomas. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

EFTA00551296


