
From: Karyna Shuliak  

To: Tenzing Nepali <I 

Cc: Daphne Wallace    >, Rich Kahn 

Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

Date: Mon, 11 Feb 2019 22:32:52 +0000 

Thank you very much! 

On Feb 11, 2019, at 6:42 PM, Tenzing Nepali < wrote: 

Great, we are confirmed. 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 
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From: Daphne Wallace < 
Sent: Monday, February 11, 2019 1:28 PM 
To: Tenzing Nepali < 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak < ; Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

Greetings Tenzing, 

Confirming Monday, 2/18 for delivery to Medley, FL 33178. 

Thank you so much for expediting the delivery for us. Kind regards, Daphne 

On Mon, Feb 11, 2019 at 12:10 PM Tenzing Nepali < 

Hi Karyne and Daphne, 

wrote: 

I hope you had a lovely weekend. My team can deliver the carpet next Monday in the AM. Please confirm if that 
works for you. 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 
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From: Karyna Shuliak < 
Sent: Friday, February 08, 2019 4:27 PM 
To: Tenzing Nepali 
Cc: Daphne Wallace < ; Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

Thank you very much Tenzing. 

On Feb 8, 2019, at 2:11 PM, Tenzing Nepali O> wrote: 

Hi Daphne and Karyna, 

Happy Friday! I just checked the tracking and it shows that we will receive it in florida by Tuesday. I have already 
emailed my workroom to see when we can deliver. I will keep you posted. 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 
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From: Tenzing Nepali 
Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 2:45 PM 
To: 'Daphne Wallace' 
Cc: Rich Kahn c 
Subject: RE: 253970 stark carpet order 

Thank you received! 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 
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From: Daphne Wallace 
Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 3:28 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak c 
Cc: Rich Kahn c >; Tenzing Nepali AO 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

• Karyna Shuliak 

Greetings Tenzing, 

Attached please find the signed credit card authorization for JSC Interiors Quote 253970. 
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Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 10:38 AM Karyna Shuliak < wrote: 

Good morning Tenzing, Daphne and Rich, 

Please see below the estimate for the rug from Tenzing. 
Rich, could you please work with Tenzing on the payment. 
Daphne, if you could please coordinate with Tenzing the shipping process to St.Thomas. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 
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