
From: Tenzing Nepali  

To: Daphne Wallace   Karyna Shuliak < 

Cc: Rich Kahn  

Subject: RE: 253970 stark carpet order 

Date: Fri, 08 Feb 2019 19:11:33 +0000 
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Hi Daphne and Karyna, 

Happy Friday! I just checked the tracking and it shows that we will receive it in florida by Tuesday. I have already emailed 
my workroom to see when we can deliver. I will keep you posted. 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 

;;ISTARK 

P. 
979 Third Avenue, 11th Floor I New York, NY 10022 
www.starkcarpet.com 

From: Tenzing Nepali 
Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 2:45 PM 
To: 'Daphne Wallace' 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: 253970 stark carpet order 

Thank you received! 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepali 
Account Manager 

le:,'STARK 

; Karyna Shuliak 

P. 
979 Third Avenue, 11th Floor I New York, NY 10022 
www.starkcarpet.com 

From: Daphne Wallace < 
Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 3:28 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Rich Kahn < ); Tenzing Nepali < 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

EFTA00552554



Greetings Tenzing, 

Attached please find the signed credit card authorization for JSC Interiors Quote 253970. 

Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 10:38 AM Karyna Shuliak > wrote: 

Good morning Tenzing, Daphne and Rich, 

Please see below the estimate for the rug from Tenzing. 
Rich, could you please work with Tenzing on the payment. 
Daphne, if you could please coordinate with Tenzing the shipping process to St.Thomas. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 
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