
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Michael Glidden <1 
Cc: Ann Rodriquez Da -ihne Wallace

To o Renato 
, Stephanie Remington 

Subject: Re: Outdoor awning 
Date: Mon, 25 Mar 2019 17:59:28 +0000 

Carluz 

any updates on this? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 2 
cell 

On Mar 18, 2019, at 11:54 AM, michael glidden  > wrote: 

Got it. 
I will chase it down. 

On Mar 18, 2019, at 11:22 AM, ann rodriquez <a wrote: 

Hi Michael, 

Please advise that you've received all info from Carluz pertaining to the Awning? 
I believe Carluz is under the impression that I'm responsible for the LSJ awning project. 

Thank you, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained In this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Monday, March 18, 2019 10:54:39 AM -04. CARLUZ TOYLO wrote: 
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Here are few photo that may help you . 

Karluz N. Toylo 
358 EL Brillo Way 
Palm Beach , FL 33480 

> On Mar 18, 2019, at 07:43, michael glidden <-> wrote: 

> Good morning. 
> I will get pricing and availability for units to go on each of the gazebos along side both pools as soon as I get the info. 
> Thank you. 

» On Mar 17, 2019, at 11:26 PM, Karyna Shuliak .t: > wrote: 
>> 

» Hi Carluz, 

» Mr. Epstein asked if you could please find out who is the manufacturer of the outdoor awning that we have by the dining 
table outside. Please give the manufacturers details to Mike. He is copied on this email. 

» Thank you, 

» Karyna 
> 
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