
From: 
To: Richard Kahn a> 

Cc: C> 
Subject: Re: invoice 

Date: Wed, 08 Aug 2012 14:43:16 +0000 

The work is complete. We did have him remove the crown molding in 8H and repair walls for painting, which 
would be an additional amount of work above the normal rate for just painting. He hadn't told me before how 
much extra it would be to do this, but this seems very reasonable. 

On Aug 7, 2012, at 4:41 PM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

> <invoice_3.doc> 
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