
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Karyna Shuliak 

Subject: Re: Bin 

Date: Tue, 02 Apr 2019 17:10:20 +0000 

Partially paid with a note ! 

On Tue, Apr 2, 2019 at 6:45 PM Karyna Shuliak < > wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Marc.Kensington"
Date: April 2, 2019 at 12:35:32 PM EDT 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Alex Peto , Mark Lloyd
Subject: Re: Bin 

Dear Karyna, 

You offered to give a 4 years loan to the vendor or was I wrong ? What means 46 million in debit during 4 
years. 

My solution is needs much less cash. 

- 21 million for Pamur paid to the vendor 
- 8 million for buying the property in Morocco 
- 29 million all together and 6 million back to Pamur owned by you after 4 years (I, 5 million in 2020, 2021, 
2022 and 2023) 
- the taxes are paid by the 8 million (for this reason only 6 million back) 
- no loan to the vendor and full control of the money going back to Pamur. 

And the vendor pays the taxes in Morocco unser your control. This is a complicated solution to manage both 
interests. But may be too complicated. 

Kindest regards 

Le mar. 2 avr. 2019 a 18:07, Karyna Shuliak >a &fit: 
Dear Marc, 

1. The tax problem is not mine and we would NEVER do anything to try to avoid. Its not the way we do 
business. 
2. Do I understand correctly that you propose I pay 21 million to vendor, 8 million to pamur plus 2 million 
for fees and tax to government subject to your trying to get a reduction? So a total of 31 million out of 
pocket and then get back 8 over 4 years ??? 

Sincerely, 
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Karyna 

On Apr 2, 2019, at 3:17 AM, Marc.Kensington < wrote: 

Dear Karyna, 

More comments about the way to close this deal would not help, many important sales happen this way 
but as the tax authorities are now aware about your project, they will survey who uses the palace and 
try to catch you. Not sure that they will succeed, but only trying would bother you. 

If you want to continue the buying process, I would suggest the following strategy: 

1) Complete the AML, even it is silly as you say. 
2) Value the Bin Ennakhil at the minimum or a little bit more than requested by the tax authorities in 
Morocco. There is a "r4ferentiel des prix de l'immobilier" for all the main cities (on internet but I can 
provide it for you and your lawyers). The value in this Palmeraie area is 1 000 dirhams / sq. m. land 
(45 700 000 dirhams) and 10 000 dirhams / sq. m. built up area, not including the basements and 
utilities (around 30 000 000 dirhams). A total value of 8 million euros (86 800 000 dirhams) is more than 
ten percent over the tax valuation. Nothing can happen, check this please with your Moroccan lawyer / 
accountant. 
Pamur sells the property to Haze Trust for this price. Follow the capital gain tax calculation with a very 
low cost estimation of 30 million dirhams (probably only a few invoices remaining after so many years), 
the amount of taxes would not exceed: (86 800 000 - 30 000 000) x 0,31 = 17 608 000 dirhams. 
Additionally, Haze Trust has to pay the registration fees. About 6 million dirhams. 
At the same time, Haze Trust buys Pamur for 21 million euros (the former 23 less 2 for the taxes and fees 
in Morocco). 
After 1, 2, 3 and 4 years, Pamur owned by the Haze Trust, recovers 25% per annum of the sale price less 
taxes. 
3) Check this way please. The most difficult will be to negotiate another price reduction of 2 million 
euros but if you agree with this strategy, I will push strongly. 
4) Coming back to the capital gain taxes of 17 608 000 dirhams. I offer to manage the tax declaration 
and reduce the amount to be paid. If this happens, we can discuss about a success fee. 

Yours sincerely 

Marc LEON 
Partner 

KENSINGTON 
Luxury Properties Sari 

Private Office Marrakech 

Tel.: 
Cell: 

www.kensingtonmorocco.com 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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