
From: Stephanie Remington < 
To: Karyna Shuliak <-

Subject: Fwd: Banquette for LSJ 
Date: Mon, 06 May 2019 17:11:55 +0000 

Good day, Karyna, 

Evalyne needs a sample of the fabric to develop the estimate. Some fabric samples from Christopher Hyland 
were left on the table in the kitchen. Would one of these happen to be the fabric he selected? If so, may I know 
which one, and may I loan her the sample? 

Thank you, 
Stephanie 

 Forwarded message  
From: Custom Canvas  
Date: Mon, May 6, 2019 at 11:41 AM 
Subject: Re: Banquette for LSJ 
To: Stephanie Remington

Yes, we can supply the foam. 

Also, We would like a small sample piece of the material that LSJ are supplying to reupholster the banquette. 
Then I can work up an estimated cost for doing the Banquette (including the cost of the foam). 

We'll want a deposit before we order anything and schedule this job to be done. 
Will let you know estimated cost sometime this week. 

It's possible that I might need to get into one of the Banquette seats to determine how that foam is shaped. 
Does anyone know the original manufacturer of the banquette seats and when they were done? 

Evelyne 

Regards, 

Christian and Evelyne Nye 

On Monday, May 6, 2019, 9:13:13 AM AST, Stephanie Remington c > wrote: 

Good morning, Evelyne, 

The owner would like to replace all the foam. Would this be something we can purchase through you, or would you 
recommend a supplier? 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE. LLC 

EFTA00554661



On Sat, 4 May 2019 at 11:02, Custom Canvas c wrote: 
40 yards for the banquette. We determined that some seats need new foam, too. 

Regards, 

Christian and Evelyne Nye 
Custom Canvas & Sails, Inc. 

On Friday, May 3, 2019, 5:08:57 PM AST, Stephanie Remington < > wrote: 

Good day, Evelyne, 

Fabric has been selected for the banquette for LSJ. It is 54" wide. Could you please advise how much should be ordered 
based on your most recent measurements? I appreciate your help. 

Thank you, 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

EFTA00554662


