From: Richard Kahn <
To: "Reception(@ greenhousestaffing. com” <receptionia greenhousestaffing.com=

Ce: Karyna Shuliak < =, Tsering Dolma

Subject: Re: Greenhouse Agency Invoice - Nangsal Lama - 6-7-19
Date: Fri, 07 Jun 2019 19:30:22 +0000

received - thank you

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

te! I

cell

On Jun 7, 2019, at 1:23 PM, Receptionf@greenhousestaffing com <reception( greenhousestaffing com> wrote:

Dear Richard,

Please see attached the Invoice for Nangsal Lama. The invoice will also be sent by US mail. Please note it is
our agency policy to send the bill when the candidate begins the trail period. The bill 1s due only if vou keep
Nangsal beyond July 2nd, 2019 which is the completion of our free trial period.

If you would like to pay using a credit/debit card through PayPal, please let us know so that we can generate a
PayPal mmvoice for you.

If there are any questions or concerns, please let us know. As always, we greatly appreciate the opportunity to
be of service.

Thank you.

Harshal Varpe
Office Manager

Greenhouse Agcy, Lid.
Phnnn:ﬂ Fax:| NI Shvpe: Greenhouse Agency

recepticni@greenhousestaffing.com

Securing the best jobs for "Experienced, Well Trained, Career Minded, Household/Domestic
Professionals”

“Piease take a lock af our always updated & immensely-helpful website: www greenhousestaffing.com

EFTA00555346



Seea all of the new services we hawve to offer. Find Jobs, Share Stores and Meet Our Staif
All Comments & Suggestions are welcome & truly appreciated!

"Household/Domestic Staff & Those Who Employ News Articles From Around The World™:
wiww. greenhousestaffing.comiblog

Write A Review | Leave a Comment | View Available Jobs | View Available Candidates

***Please see us on |;j Facebook and give us a "like!!"

aal
55 West 30th Street, Suite 308
Mew York, NY 10018

<Epstein (Karyna Shuliak) - Nangsal Lama - 6-7-2019.PDF>
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